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From: Nanik Sri Utaminingsih <nie.pasadena@gmail.com>
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To: Indira Januarti <ienjanuarti@gmail.com>
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---------- Forwarded message --------- 
Dari: IJSTR Research Publication <donotreply@ijstr.org> 
Date: Sel, 24 Des 2019 pukul 04.30 
Subject: IJSTR :: Notification of Papers Acceptance - IJSTR-0120-29933 
To: <nie.pasadena@gmail.com> 
 
 
Dear Author, 
 
Greetings from the Editorial Team of IJSTR Research Publications! Thank you very much for presenting your paper for the
evaluation of IJSTR's Review Board. 
 
Congratulations...! Hereby we confirm the provisional acceptance of your paper titled "Control Effectiveness and Fraud:
Evidence in Indonesia Cooperative" to be published in our International Journal - International Journal of Scientific &
Technology Research - [Impact Factor: 3.023] for January 2020 edition. 
 
Reference Number : IJSTR-0120-29933 
 
Actions Suggested: Please submit the following forms: 
 
1) Registration Form [http://www.ijstr.org/Registration-Form.pdf] 
 
2) Copyright Form [http://www.ijstr.org/Copyright-Agreement.pdf] 
 
Please upload the duly signed & scanned copy of the above mentioned documents at [http://www.ijstr.org/upload-docs.php?
id=Mjk5MzM=] within 7 days of acceptance of this email for timely publication. 
(You can download the forms from http://www.ijstr.org/download.php) 
 
Publishing fee: 
Kindly proceed with the publishing fee ($ 65) for online publication of papers. This fee is towards publication, communication and
distribution costs. 
 
You can use this link http://www.ijstr.org/publication-charge.php for submitting publication fee or contact our payment desk using
http://www.ijstr.org/contact.php for any clarification required on publishing fee. 
 
*Important: 
Please ensure to complete all the above mentioned next steps by 05 Jan 2020 to ensure timely publication.  
 
Further if you have any query, please feel free to write us using http://www.ijstr.org/contact.php - we always seek your valuable
inputs to improve the quality of our IJSTR. 
 
 
Thanks 
Publication Team 
www.ijstr.org
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